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9455 ENTERPRISE DRIVE                      MOKENA, IL 60448
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Illinois Professional Engineer No. 062-043406

Prepared at or under the direction of:

 RETAIL BUILDING
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LOT 3 LARAWAY & WOLF  ROAD

FRANKFORT, IL 60423

SITE IMPROVEMENT PLANS

SIGNED:___________

LIC. EXP: _________

11-30-23

ILLINOIS PROFESSIONAL DESIGN FIRM NO. 184-001172

CONTACT:

ERIC SMITH

2205 LAKESIDE DRIVE

BANNOCKBURN, IL 60015

 PHONE:847.945.6869

       esmith@kmaarch.com

1.   The Village of Frankfort, Department of Public Works, and

      Department of Engineering, (Telephone 1-815-469-2177),

      and Joseph A. Schudt & Associates (Telephone 1-708-720-1000)

      must be notified 2 working days prior to commencement of work.

2.   Elevation is U.S.G.S. Datum.  (NAVD 88)

3.   All floor drains shall discharge to the sanitary sewer.

4.   All downspouts and footing drains shall discharge to the storm sewer.

5.   All sanitary sewer construction requires stone bedding 1/4 inch to 1 inch in

      size, with a minimum thickness equal to 1/4 the outside diameter of the

      sewer pipe, but not less than 4 inches, nor greater than eight inches.  Bedding

      material shall be CA-11 and shall be extended at least 12 inches above top of

      pipe when using non-rigid (PVC) pipe.

6.   "Band Seal" or similar flexible-type couplings shall be used for the

      connection of sewer pipe of dissimilar materials.

7.   When connecting to an existing sewer main by means other than an existing

      wye, tee, or an existing manhole, one of the following methods shall be

      used:

      a.  Circular saw-cut of sewer main by proper tools ("Sewer Tap" machine or

           similar) and proper installation of hub-wye saddle or hub-tee saddle.

      b.  Remove an entire section of pipe (breaking only the top of the bell) and

           replace with a wye or tee branch section.

      c.  With pipe cutter, neatly and accurately cut out desired length of pipe for

           insertion of proper fitting, using "Band-Seal" or similar couplings to hold

           it firmly in place.

8.   Wherever a sewer crosses under a watermain, the minimum vertical distance

      from the top of the sewer to the watermain shall be 18 inches.  Furthermore,

      a minimum horizontal distance of 10 feet between storm and/or sanitary and

      watermains shall be maintained unless:  the sewer is laid in a separate trench,

      keeping a minimum 18 inch vertical separation; or the sewer is laid in the

      same trench with the watermain located at the opposite side on a bench of

      undisturbed earth, keeping a minimum 18 inch vertical separation.  If either

      the vertical or horizontal distances described above cannot be maintained,

      or the sewer crosses above the watermain, then, for a distance of 10 feet

      on either side of the watermain, the sewer pipe shall be PVC pressure

      pipe material or the watermain shall be constructed in a watertight casing.

9.   Contractor shall bend watermain pipe uniformly under sewers without

      using fittings providing that joint deflection does not exceed 5 degrees

      per joint for pipe under 12 inches in size and 3 degrees per joint for pipe

      14 inches and over in size.  All crossing (including services) shall have

      a minimum of 18 inches of clearance and should extend 10 feet each

      side of the center of the crossing.

10. All sanitary manholes shall have a minimum inside diameter of 48 inches.

      Manhole steps shall be 16" min. wide plastic w/continuous 1/2 steel

      reinforcement, M.A. Industries or equal.

11. All sanitary sewer, storm sewer, and water system construction shall

      conform to the "Standard Specifications for Water and Sewer Main

      Construction in Illinois", current edition.

12. All paving and related improvements shall be constructed in accordance

      with the Illinois Department of Transportation, "Standard Specifications

      for Road and Bridge Construction in Illinois", current edition. As noted on plans.

13. All trenches caused by the construction of sewers, watermains, water

      service pipes, and in excavation around catch basins, manholes, inlets,

      and other appurtenances which occur within the limits of, or within 3 feet

      of existing or proposed pavements, sidewalks, and curb and gutters shall

      be backfilled with trench backfill.  Trench backfill shall be CA-6 Grade 8

      material to subgrade and shall be mechanically compacted in 12" lifts.

14. 12", 10" & 8" diameter sanitary sewer pipe and fittings shall be PVC pipe, SDR 26

      (ASTM D-3034) with flexible elastometric (O-ring) gaskets (ASTM D-3212), unless

      otherwise noted.  Where 6" diameter sanitary service crosses below watermain

      with less than 18 inches of separation, or where indicated elsewhere on plans,

      6" service shall be DIP pipe (ANSI 2151) with gasket joints (ANSI 21.11).  Sanitary

      sewers shall be air tested, mandrel tested, and televised.  Sanitary sewer manholes

      shall be provided with internal chimney seals (Cretex or equal).  All Sanitary

      Manholes shall be provided with mac wrap at barrel section joints.  Sanitary sewer

      manholes shall be air tested in accordance with ASTM C-1244-93, Standard Test

      Method for Concrete Sewer Manholes by Negative Air Pressure (Vacuum) Test.

15. All new watermain shall be C900 PVC pipe.  All watermain fittings, valves, and

      hydrants shall have stainless steel bolts and shall be secured using Meg-A-Lug

      restrained joints.  Thrust blocking shall also be provided, with precast blocking

      permitted.  Watermain shall be pressure tested at 150psi for two hours.  A

      leakage test will be performed in accordance with "Standard Specifications

      for Water and Sewer Construction in Illinois", current edition.  A disinfection

      test shall be completed using an initial chlorine concentration of 50 mg/l and

      a minimum residual concentration of 25 mg/l after 24 hours.  All work shall

      comply with Village of Frankfort standards.

16. Watermains and lot services shall be a minimum of 5.0 feet below

      finished ground surface.  A 5 foot patch on both sides of the trench.

      Full depth Class D patch within the trench area.  The 5 foot areas

      on both sides of the trench are required to be patched with 2-1/2"

      binder and 1-1/2" of surface.  Public Works inspections are

      required during the restoration process.

17.  a.  All storm sewer must be reinforced concrete pipe in paved areas.

       b.  All reinforced concrete pipe shall be ASTM C76 CL IV.

       c.  Sump pump discharge piping shall be PVC Schedule 40.

       d.  Joints shall conform to ASTM C443.

18.  Where storm sewers cross over the tops of watermains and are designated

       as "LHP" type, they shall be reinforced concrete low head pressure pipe

       (ASTM C-361-76).  Alternately, proper watermain protection per note (8.)

       shall be provided.

19.  All bends in the watermain of 10 degrees or greater shall be installed with

       restrained joints (Meg-A-Lug or equal).  Restrained joints (Meg-A-Lug or

       equal) shall be used within three pipe lengths of a fitting.  No thrust blocking

       is allowed.

20.  All rims and inverts of existing sanitary and storm sewer shall be field verified

       prior to the start of construction, and any discrepancies between the plan

       and existing elevations shall be reported to the Engineer immediately.

21.  All coordinates refer to back of curb, centerline of manhole, pipe, or structure,

       or as shown.

22.  All curb radii refer to back of curb.  Lane dimensions refer to face of curb or

       edge of pavement.

23.  The Contractor shall subscribe to all governing regulations and shall obtain all

       necessary public agency permits.

24.  Field check all dimensions, coordinates, and elevations before proceeding with

       new work.  Notify the Engineer of any discrepancies immediately.

25.  The Contractor shall provide for the safe and orderly passage of traffic and

       pedestrians where his operations abut public thoroughfares and adjacent property.

26.  Construction access points to the site shall be protected in such a way as to

       prevent tracking of mud or soil onto public thoroughfares.  At the end of each

       day, the Contractor shall clean up all mud or soil which has been tracked onto

       public streets or as required by the Village of Frankfort.

27.  Street paving and curbs to remain shall be protected from damage and, if

       damaged, shall be replaced promptly to meet Village of Frankfort Standard

       Specifications in materials and workmanship.

28.  Prior to new work, the Contractor shall verify the location and elevation of

       existing utility lines and structures to be connected to proposed work.

       Discrepancies shall be reported to the Engineer immediately.

29.  All sediment will be prevented from entering any existing storm drainage

       systems by the use of hay bales, interceptor dikes or other approved

       functional methods.  The Contractor shall be responsible for removing

       sediment resulting from this project from storm sewers and drainage structures.

30.  All utility connections to existing lines shall be constructed in accordance with

       the regulations of the utility owner and to the satisfaction of the utility owner.

31.  All work shall be in accordance with the specifications for the Village of Frankfort.

32.  New watermain valves, including pressure tap valves, adjacent to an existing

       watermain, and existing watermain valves shall only be operated by the Village of

       Frankfort, Department of Public Works personnel with a 48-hour notice (Monday-Friday).

33.  Any existing utility structures requiring adjustment are to be adjusted (up to

       6" total adjustment allowed with a maximum of 2 precast concrete rings) or

       reconstructed by the contractor to the utility owner's satisfaction.  Adjustments or

       reconstructions not called for on the plans shall be considered incidental to the

       contract.  A total of no more than 6" and no less than 4 inches of adjusting rings

       shall be provided at all utility structures.  Adjusting rings shall be set in a bed of

       preformed non-hardening mastic (RUB-R-NEK or approved equal).  The upper

       adjusting ring shall be made of recycled rubber (Infra-Riser brand or equal).

34.  All connections to existing manholes shall be made by coring the existing

       manhole using a diamond or carbide tip cutter and installing a press seal

       PSX or CORE-N-SEAL boot in the cored opening.

35.  All storm sewer flared end sections for pipes greater than 12 inch diameter

       shall be provided with grates per I.D.O.T. standards.

36.  Reproducible "Record" drawings shall be provided by the contractor to

       the Village of Frankfort and Owner following completion of improvements.

37.  Structure lids shall be stamped "VILLAGE OF FRANKFORT" and "SANITARY",

       "STORM", or "WATER" for appropriate utilities.

38.  Sanitary and Water stubs shall be marked with 4" x 4" wood posts.

39.  One lane in each direction shall be open to traffic at all times except between

       the hours of 9 A.M. to 3 P.M.  During this period all work must be performed

       in accordance with standards 701201, 701206, and 701401.

40.  Traffic control standards which shall be included for use during construction are:

       702001, 701201, 701206, 701301, 701401, 701501, 701606, and 701701.

41.  The owner and/or contractor shall be responsible for verifying soil conditions

       and subgrade conditions.

INDEMNIFICATION LANGUAGE

INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS - The Applicant and the
Contractor shall indemnify the Municipality and the Municipal Engineer, their officials,
officers, employees, and agents acting in the scope and course of  their employment and shall
protect them from claims arising out of  or in connection with any operation of  the Applicant
or Contractor including personal injury, death; or, for destruction of or damage to property.

The Applicant and Contractor shall also protect the Municipality and the Municipal Engineer
by including them as additional insured on their Comprehensive General Liability Insurance
Policy.  The minimum level of  insurance shall be as specified in Section 107.27 GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS AND COVENANTS of  the Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge
Construction by the Illinois Department of  Transportation.  “Claims Made” type policies are
unacceptable.  Certificates of  Insurance shall be filed and approved by the Municipality and
Robinson Engineering, Ltd., the Municipal Engineer, a minimum of 5 days before starting
construction.

PERSONAL LIABILITY - In carrying out any of  their duties or in exercising any power or
authority granted to the Municipal Engineer by the Municipality, there shall be no personal
liability upon the Municipal Engineer or their authorized representative, it being understood
that in such matters they act as agents and representatives of  the Municipality.  By beginning
work, the Applicant and Contractor covenants and agrees that is shall neither commence nor
prosecute any action or suit whatsoever against the Municipal Engineer or Municipality, their
officials, officers, employees or agents in any action or omission done or not done in the
course of  their duties.  Further, by beginning work, the Applicant and Contractor agrees to pay
all attorney fees and all costs incurred by the Municipality or Municipal Engineer, its officials,
officers, employees or agents because of any action or suit in violation of this Article.

HOLD HARMLESS - The Applicant and Contractor doing work, shall hereby defend,
indemnify, keep, and save harmless the Municipality and the Municipal Engineer, and their
respective legislative and board members, representatives, agents, and employees in both
individual and official capabilities against all suits, claims, damages, losses, and expenses,
including attorney's fees, caused by or growing out of, or incidental to, the performance of  the
work by the Applicant or the Contractor to the full extent allowed by the laws of  the State of
Illinois and not beyond any extent which would render these provisions void or unenforceable.

CONSTRUCTION OBSERVATION - All materials and each part of  detail of  the work
portrayed on these Plans may be subject at any time to observation by the Municipal Engineer. 
Observation may be made at the site, or at the source of  material supply, whether that is at a
mill, plant, ship, etc.  The Municipal Engineer shall be allowed access to all parts of  the Work
and shall be furnished with such information and assistance by the Applicant and Contractor
as needed to perform these observations.  The Contractor shall be held strictly to the true
intent of the Plans in regard to quality of materials and workmanship.

The Municipal Engineer is not responsible for safety on the work site nor does the Municipal
Engineer have any duty to review in any manner the adequacy of  the Contractor's safety
measures incident to the work portrayed on these Plans.

The Municipal Engineer is not responsible for any construction means, methods, techniques,
sequences or procedures for the work portrayed on these Plans.

The Municipal Engineer has no charge of the construction and has no right, duty, or
responsibility to stop work because of  any Contractor's failure to follow proper safety
precautions.  The Municipal Engineer is not responsible for the acts, errors or omissions of
any Applicant, Engineer or Contractor, or any of  their agents or employees or any other
person performing any of the Work portrayed on these Plans.
 

The Contractor shall, upon written notice from the Municipality, remove or uncover such
portions of  the finished Work, as it may direct, before the final acceptance of  the same.  After
examination, the Contractor shall restore said portion of  the Work to the standard required by
these Plans.  The expense of  uncovering, removing and replacement shall be borne by the
Applicant and/or the Contractor; and, not the Municipality nor the Municipal Engineer.

Any reference to “supervision” by the Engineer in the Illinois Department of  Transportation,
Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction, or any other referenced documents
shall be changed to “observation”.

SS

                             Engineer                                   

COUNTY OF WILL

STATE OF ILLINOIS

To the best of our knowledge and belief the drainage of surface waters will not be

changed by the construction of such subdivision or any part thereof, or, that if such

surface water drainage will be changed, reasonable provisions have been made for the

collection and discharge of surface waters into public or private areas and/or drains

which the subdivider has the right to use, and that such surface waters will be planned

for in accordance with generally accepted engineering practices so as to reduce the

likelihood of substantive damage to adjoining property because of the construction of

the subdivision.

Dated this  15 day of APRIL 2021.

}

SURFACE WATER DRAINAGE CERTIFICATE

Village of Frankfort Standard Specifications shall govern

all utility matters and shall supercede general conditions

and specifications when and where in conflict.

CONTACT JULIE AT 811 OR 800-892-0123

WITH THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION

COUNTY-NAME

CITY / TOWNSHIP

SEC & 1/4 SEC No.

48 HOURS (2 working days) BEFORE YOU DIG

Know what's below.
before you dig.Call

R

               WILL

          FRANKFORT

SW 1/4 SEC 30, TWN 35 N, R 12 E.   

LOT 3 IN THE WOLF AND LARAWAY LLC SUBDIVISION, BEING A SUBDIVISION OF PART OF THE SOUTHWEST QUARTER OF

SECTION 30, TOWNSHIP 35 NORTH, RANGE 12 EAST OF THE THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN,  IN WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS.

P.I.N. 19-09-30-401-063-0000

PROPERTY CONTAINS: 35,764 SQ. FT. (0.821 ACRES), MORE OR LESS.

INDEX

Sheet Number Sheet Title

1 COVER SHEET

2 EXISTING TOPOGRAPHY

3 SITE LAYOUT PLAN

4 SITE GRADING PLAN

5 SITE UTILITY PLAN

6 SITE EROSION CONTROL PLAN

7 STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN

8 CONSTRUCTION SPECIFICATIONS

9 CONSTRUCTION DETAILS

10 CONSTRUCTION DETAILS

BENCH MARK:

TOP OF THE NORTHWEST FLANGE BOLT OF HYDRANT. LOCATED  WEST OF WOLF ROAD, THE FIRST HYDRANT ON THE NORTH

SIDE OF LARAWAY ROAD .  ELEVATION: 739.38
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